
ORDINANCE NO. 2018-8 
 

AN ORDINANCE APPROPRIATING $4,400.00 FROM THE CAPITAL FUND BALANCE FOR 
LIGHTING RENOVATIONS TO BOROUGH HALL BY THE  

BOROUGH OF ELMER, COUNTY OF SALEM, STATE OF NEW JERSEY 
              

 
WHEREAS, the Borough of Elmer Council received an audit from the Direct Install 

Program (NJ Clean Energy) for energy efficiency upgrades in the Borough Hall that resulted in 
an agreement to upgrade the lighting for an estimated sum of $12,000.00; and 

 
WHEREAS, the terms and conditions of the agreement with the Direct Install Program 

(NJ Clean Energy) requires the Borough to provide 30% of the total costs for said lighting 
renovations for an estimated amount of $4,400.00; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Mayor and Council of the Borough of Elmer deem it in the best interest 

of the Borough to appropriate $4,400.00 from the Capital Fund Balance for lighting renovations 
to Borough Hall; and  

 
WHEREAS, the Mayor and Council of the Borough of Elmer find the lighting renovation 

to Borough Hall is an important public concern and is necessary to implement, and will create 
savings in the Borough’s utility bills. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED, by the Mayor and Borough Council of the 

Borough of Elmer, in the County of Salem and State of New Jersey, as follows: 
 
Section 1.  
 
The amount of $4,400.00 is hereby appropriated from the Capital Fund Balance for lighting 
renovations to Borough Hall, including all work and materials incidental thereto, and all costs 
and expenditures related thereto, in and by the Borough of Elmer, in the County of Salem, State 
of New Jersey. 
 
Section 2. 
 
The Borough hereby certifies that it has adopted a capital budget or a temporary capital budget, 
as applicable.  The capital or temporary capital budget of the Borough is hereby amended to 
confirm with the provisions of this ordinance to the extent of any inconsistency herewith.  To the 
extent that the purposes authorized herein are inconsistent with the adopted capital or 
temporary capital budget, a revised capital or temporary capital budget has been filed with the 
Division of Local Government Services. 
 
Section 3. 
 
Repealer. 
 

All prior Ordinances or parts of Ordinances inconsistent with this Ordinance be and the same 
are hereby repealed to the extent of such inconsistencies. 
 



 

Section 4. 
 
Severability. 
 
Should any section, clause, sentence, phrase or provision of this Ordinance be declared 
unconstitutional or invalid by a Court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the 
remaining portions of this Ordinance.  
 
Section 4. 
 
When effective. 
 
This Ordinance shall take effect immediately upon final passage and publication in accordance 
with law. 

BOROUGH OF ELMER 

 
 
BY:       
      Joseph Stemberger, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 
      
Sarah D. Walker 
Registered Municipal Clerk 
 
ROLL CALL VOTE as follows: 

 MOTION SECOND AYES NAYS ABSTAIN ABSENT 

Schneider _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ 

Davis _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ 

Nolan _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ 

Richards _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ 

Schalick _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ 

Zee _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ _____ 

 
NOTICE 

 
The Ordinance published herein was introduced and passed upon first reading at a 

meeting of the Mayor and Council of the Borough of Elmer, in the County of Salem and State of 
New Jersey, held on May 9, 2018.  It will be further considered for final passage, after public 
hearing hereon, at a meeting of said Mayor and Council to be held in the Borough Hall, 120 
South Main Street, Elmer, New Jersey 08318, on June 13, 2018 at 7:30 P.M.  During the week 
prior and up to and including the date of such meeting, copies of said Ordinance will be made 
available at the Clerk's office at Borough Hall, 120 South Main Street,  in the Borough, to the 
members of the general public who shall request the same.  

 
 
       
Sarah D. Walker 
Registered Municipal Clerk 


